
Corrigendum-1 

 

The following amendment has been made to the tender SKI1420P20/04. Hence, the revised 

specification/clause shall now be applicable. 

 

Tender Clause 
no.  

Original tender Clause Revised clause 

BEC-BRC , clause 
(A) Technical,  

1. Bid should be complete in all 
aspect covering the entire scope of 
supply and should conform to the 
technical specifications indicated in 
the bid documents duly supported 
with technical catalogues / 
literatures wherever required. 
Incomplete and non-conforming 
bids will be rejected outright. 
 
2. The Bidder shall be in the 
business of manufacturing of Foam 
Compound for last 5 (Five) years 
preceding to the Bid Closing date of 
this Tender. 
 
2.1 Copy of "Certificate of 
Incorporation" and "NSIC" or 
equivalent Certificate specifying the 
nature of business of the firm shall 
be furnished along with the bid. 
 
2.2 The bidder should submit the 
order book (list of completed 
orders) for last five years 
mentioning following details: 
i. Purchase Order No. 
ii. Purchase Order Date 
iii. Organization to whom supplied 
iv. Quantity 
v. Supply Date 
 
3. The bidder should have the 
experience of successful execution 
of supply of at least 1 (one) order 
for the tendered item (supply of 

1.         Bid should be complete in all 
aspect covering the entire scope of 
supply and should conform to the 
technical specifications indicated in 
the bid documents duly supported 
with technical catalogues / 
literatures wherever required. 
Incomplete and non-conforming 
bids will be rejected outright. 
 
2.         The Bidder shall be in the 
business of manufacturing of Fire 
Extinguishers for last 5 (Five) years 
preceding to the Bid Closing date of 
this Tender. 
 
2.1       Copy of (a) "Certificate of 
Incorporation" along with (b) 
"Memorandum of Association" or 
"NSIC" or equivalent document 
wherein the present business of the 
firm is clearly mentioned, shall be 
furnished along with the bid." 
 
2.2       The bidder should submit 
the order book (list of completed 
orders) for last five years 
mentioning following details: 
i.          Purchase Order No. 
ii.         Purchase Order Date 
iii.        Organization to whom 
supplied 
iv.        Quantity 
v.         Supply Date 
 
3.         The bidder should have the 



Fire Extinguishers) for 50% of 
tendered quantity i.e. 500 Nos. in 
the last 5 (five) years preceding to 
Bid Closing date of this Tender. 
Copy of purchase Orders and Proof 
of Supply/ Performance Report 
shall be submitted along with bid. 
 
4. The copy of valid ISI certificate 
shall be submitted along with bid. 
 
5. The bidder should have the 
manufacturing facility and 
adequate testing /quality assurance 
facility of Fire Extinguisher. The list 
of the necessary machinery / 
Equipment for manufacturing & 
testing of Foam Compound shall be 
submitted along with bid. 

 

Note: The original Bid Closing date 
shall be considered by OIL for 
evaluation of BRC Criteria even in 
case of any extension of the 
original Bid closing date. Bidders to 
quote accordingly. 
 

experience of successful execution 
of supply of at least 1 (one) order 
for the tendered item 
(Manufacturing and supply of Fire 
Extinguishers) for 50% of tendered 
quantity i.e. 500 Nos. (Five 
Hundred) in the last 5 (five) years 
preceding to Bid Closing date of this 
Tender. Copy of purchase Orders 
and Proof of Supply/ Performance 
Report shall be submitted along 
with bid. 
 
4.         A copy of valid ISI certificates 
for Extinguisher and Dry Chemical 
Powder shall be submitted along 
with bid. 
 
Note: The original Bid Closing date 
shall be considered by OIL for 
evaluation of BRC Criteria even in 
case of any extension of the 
original Bid closing date. Bidders to 
quote accordingly. 
 

BIDDER’S 
RESPONSE SHEET 
SKI1420P20/04 
 

Annexure HHH attached separately Revised Annexure HHH attached 
seperately 

SPECIAL NOTES SPECIAL NOTES attached separately  ‘Revised Special Notes’ attached 
separately. 

 

 

All other terms and conditions of the tender remain unchanged. 


