
CORRIGENDUM-1 TO TENDER NO CGI8419P19 

 

The quantity, Unit and internal rate of SOQ  from item No 11 to 17 of the TENDER NO CGI8419P19 has 

been interchanged due to inadvertent typographical error. Bidders are requested to read the same 

correctly and consider the quantity under the rate column, rate under Unit Column and Unit under 

Quantity column. All other terms and conditions and total value of the tender will remain same. The 

correct SOQ from item 11 to 17  will be as per below mentioned table. 
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11 

Reinforced cement concrete 

work in colum: 
Reinforced cement concrete 

work in column beam walls (at 
any height thicknessetc ), 
including attached pilasters, 

as directed by Engineer-in 
charge. 

270.00 M3 6,78

9 

18,33,0

30.00 

     



12 

Reinforcement for R.C.C. 

work: 
Reinforcement for R.C.C. work 
including straightening, 

cutting, bending, placing in 
position and binding all 
complete 

36,000 KG 64.2

8 

2,314,0

80.00 

     

13 

 Brick masonry with 
common burnt clay: 

Brick masonry with common 
burnt clay F.P.S. (non 

modular) bricks of class 
designation 7.5 in foundation 
and plinth in 1 Cement 

mortar 1:4 (1 cement : 4 
coarse sand) 

200.00 M3 6,68
0.55 

13,36,1
10.00 

     

14 

12mm cement plaster of 
mix:1:4 : 
Providing 12mm cement 

plaster of mix:1:4 (1 cement : 
4 fine sand) 

1,800 M2 164.
30 

2,95,74
0.00 

     

15 

Providing ,Supplying 
Structural steel: 
Providing ,Supplying 

Structural steel such as tees, 
angles channels and R.S. 

joists bolted welded fabricated 
as instructed by Engineer-in 
charge. 

10,500.
00 

KG 64.2
2 

6,74,31
0.00 

     

16 
Wall painting with acrylic  
paint: 

1,700 M2 80.2
3 

1,36,39
1.00 

     



Wall painting with acrylic 

emulsion paint of approved 
brand and manufacture to 
give an even shade to give an 

even shade 

17 

Providing and fixing 

concertina coil fence: 
Providing and fixing 
concertina coil fencing with 

punched tape concertina coil 
600 mm dia 10 metre operable 

length ( total length 90 m), 
having 50 nos rounds per 6 
metre length, upto 3 m height 

of wall with existing angle iron 
'Y' shaped placed 2.4 m or 
3.00 m apart and with 9 

horizontal R.B.T. reinforced 
barbed wire, stud tied with 

G.I. staples and G.I. clips to 
retain horizontal, including 
necessary bolts or G.I barbed 

wire tied to angle iron, all 
complete as per direction of 

Engineer-in-charge with 
reinforced barbed tape(R.B.T.) 
/ Spring core (2.5mm thick) 

wire of high tensile strength of 
165 kg/ sq.mm with tape 
(0.52 mm thick) and weight 

43.478 gm/ metre 

850 M 272.

70 

2,31,79

5.00 

     



 

 


